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SEPTEMBER 24, 2018 
 

 











CONSENT AGENDA.   
(The following consent items may be acted upon in one motion). 

1. Approve payment of County invoices in the amount of 
 $ 225,052.30. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



























































 

 

 
 

 

 
2. Ratify re-occurring County payments in the amount 
 of:  

A. $ 302,295.96  
 (Payroll for 09/01/2018 - 09/15/2018) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 







































 

 

 
 

 

 

B. $ 91,691.99 
   (Payroll Tax for 09/01/2018 - 09/15/2018) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 





 

 

 
 

 

 

C.  $  45,264.04  (Utilities) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Bill Name Location Aug-18

Maxwell Water Supply Corp. Hwy 142/CCR 239 & FM 1966   JP 3 35.99         

MAXWELL WATER SUPPLY CORP. - TOTAL 35.99         

Polonia Water Supply Corp. Caldwell County Unit Rd 35.38         

Polonia Water Supply Corp. Caldwell Co. Prect. 4-49 Civic Dr., Dale, TX 23.06         

POLONIA WATER SUPPLY CORP. - TOTAL 58.44         

Texas Gas Service Caldwell County Jail #2, 1204 Reed Rd  CCSO 968.37       

Caldwell County 405 E. Market, Lockhart 73.65         

County Bldg Luling, 510 E Pierce, Luling 72.91         

Caldwell County #2, 401 E. Market, Lockhart 73.65         

Caldwell Cty Juv Prob Dept 75.76         

Caldwell Co. New Building-1703 S. Colorado 115.66       

TEXAS GAS SERVICE - TOTAL 1,380.00    

City of Lockhart - CALDCO 01 Caldwell Co. Annex, 405 E. Market 304.44       

Caldwell Co. Annex, 405 E. Market 437.59       

CITY OF LOCKHART - CALDCO 01 -TOTAL 742.03       

City of Lockhart - CALDCO 02 Caldwell Co. Annex, 110 S. Main 1,953.47    

Bkroom, 312 E. San Antonio  SERVER RM 248.18       

CC  Juvenile Prob. Dept, 312 E. San Antonio 774.87       

CC Annex, CC Courthouse, 401 E. Market 883.59       

CC District Resource Cent, 401 E. Market - DRC 663.84       

Caldwell Co. Annex, 110 S. Main-Sprinkler 38.83         

CC Judicial Center, 1703 S. Colorado 8,695.71    

CC Judicial Center, 1703 S. Colorado 58.83         

Caldwell Co. Annex, 1196 Reed Dr.-Barn MAINT. 199.89       

Caldwell Co. Annex, Blackjack 2,332.62    

Caldwell Co. Annex, 1204 Reed Dr.   CCSO 21,650.46  

Caldwell Co. Annex, 1403 Blackjack-LW School 287.08       

Caldwell Co. Annex, 1403 Blackjack-Maint Bldg 242.71       

CITY OF LOCKHART - CALDCO 02 - TOTAL 38,030.08 

City of Luling - CALDWELL Caldwell Co-JP/County Auditor, 508 N. Fannin St 268.32       

Caldwell Co-Adult/Juv Serv, 512 E. Fannin St. 132.27       

Caldwell Co. Welfare Off, 505 E. Fannin St. 128.55       

Caldwell Co Prec. #2, 423 San Marcos Hwy. 49.92         

CITY OF LULING - CALDWELL - TOTAL 579.06       

Bluebonnet Electric Caldwell County Precint #3 298.06       

Caldwell County Prec 4 96.77         

Bluebonnet Electric Caldwell County URS 506.46       

Sanitation - meter no: 122860878/43673230 165.57       

BLUEBONNET ELECTRIC - TOTAL 1,066.86    

Total Utilities Paid: 41,892.46

Statement date usually end of 

the month.



 

 

 
 

 

 

D. $  152,945.45  (Department of Motor Vehicle Fees) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 





 

 

 
 

 

E. $  461,457.50  (Texas Motor Vehicle Sales/Use Tax 
 and Surcharge)  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 





 

 

 
 

 

F.    $  18,942.32   (Texas Motor Vehicle Registration 
 Surcharge/Title Application Fees) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 





 

 

 
 

 

G. $   255.51   (Texas Boat and Boat Motor Sales and 
 Use Tax Report) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 





 

 

 
 

 

3. Accept the August 2018 Tax Collection Report 
 submitted by the Caldwell County Appraisal District. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 









 

 

 
 

 

4. Accept the Adopted 2019 Caldwell County Appraisal 
 District Budget. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



















 

 

 
 

 

5. Approve payment and accept Continuation Certificate 
 of Surety Bond # 62926227 for Unit Road 
 Administrator, Donald LeClerc, for a term of one year 
 beginning on October 1, 2018. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 









 

 

 
 

 

ACTION AGENDA ITEMS 
 
6. Discussion/Action regarding the burn ban. Cost: 
 None; Speaker: Judge Schawe / Carine Chalfoun; 
 Backup: None.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 

 
 

 

7. Discussion/Action to publicly award the bid for 
 aggregate, asphalt materials, flexible base,  fuel (regular 
 unleaded and #2 diesel), oil and lubricants for the Fiscal 
 Year 2018-2019. The cost  is aligned to the FY 2018-2019 
 proposed budget. Cost: None;  Speaker: Judge Schawe; 
 Backup: 5.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Brauntex 

Materials
Centex Materials

Colorado 

Materials
Duran Gravel, Inc.

Aggregate - Grade 3 - Cover Stone (1/2") (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) no bid $21.00 $25.00 $20.00/yard

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX no bid no bid $31.89 no bid

Aggregate - Grade 4 - Cover Stone (3/8") (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) $20.00 no bid $25.00 no bid

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX $30.00 no bid $31.89 no bid

9.10.18

Caldwell County

Unit Road Bid Summary

Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Aggregate



Caldwell County

Unit Road Bid Summary

Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Ergon Asphalt & 

Emulsions, Inc.

SS1 Slow Set Emulsion (per gallon)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) $2.27

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX $2.40

HFRS2 Rapid Set Emulsion (per gallon)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) $2.27

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX $2.40

9.10.18

Asphalt Materials

"Federal Environmental Fee will be added to above prices 

at rate of $.49770/ton for asphalt & polymer loads or 

$.00150/gal for emulsion loads."



Caldwell County

Unit Road Bid Summary

Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Petroleum Traders
Triples/JOC Oil 

Company

Schmidt & Sons, 

Inc.

Sun Cost 

Resources, Inc.

Profit Margin for Supplier $0.0074 0.0795 $0.0125 $0.0990

Regular Unleaded (per gallon) $2.1304 $2.4975 $2.1491 $2.2321

various/ to 

include/ Flint Hills

Flint Hills 

Resources-E1087
Flint Hills

Various 

Unbranded

Profit Margin for Supplier $0.0074 0.0795 $0.0125 $0.0790

No 2. Diesel (Low Sulfur)(per gallon) $2.3504 $2.8135 $2.3089 $2.3363

various/includes 

Flint Hills & 

Motiva

Flint Hills 

Resources-TX LED
Flint Hills

Various 

Unbranded

9.10.18

NOTE: During the term of this contract, fuel prices may increase or decreased based on the weekly average OPIS oruces from the Austin, TX rack.  The amount designated as the supplier's profit 

margin per gallon will remain constant for the term of the contract.

Fuel & Diesel



Caldwell County

Unit Road Bid Summary

Bid Opening - 9-10-18

American Lube 

Supply

Allied 

Sales/Golden 

West/JOC Oil 

Company

Schmidt & Sons
Sun Coast 

Resources, Inc.

Safety-Kleen 

Environmental 

Sales

Motor Oil SAE 15W-40 in Bulk (per gallon) $6.11 $7.41 $6.89 $8.17 $6.75

Bel Ray Syn Blend 

15/40 CK4

Golden West 

Heavy Duty CK-4 

15w40

Warren 

Lubriguard Syn 

Blend

Total Rubia TIR 

7900 15w40

Performance Plus 

Heavy Duty Diesel 

Synthetic Blend 

Engine Oil 15w40 

CK-4

Hydraulic Fluid in Bulk (per gallon) $6.38 $6.78 $5.85 $7.41 $5.49

Quantum 

Hyperion J20C 

Tractor Hyd

Golden West 

Premium Tractor 

Hyd.

Warren Premium 

Tractor Fluid

Total Dynatrans 

MP

Performance Plus 

Universal Tractor 

Fluid

Chassis Grease

Per Cartridge $2.62 $2.054/tube $2.99 $2.35 $3.20

Per 5 gallon can $112.32 $69.51/pail $122.94 $87.50 $119.00

Hyperion Red 

HDEP2

Golden West MP-

Red Grease

Chevron Starplex 

#2

Total Multis 

Complex EP2

Performance Plus 

Construction Red 

Grease

Anti-Freeze 

Per 55 gallon drum $406.45 $329.00 $340.00 $543.40 $375.00

per 1 gallon $7.39 no bid $6.75 $9.47 $6.82

Prestone

All Temp Ext Life 

Red Antifreeze 

50/50

Marcus Products
Chev.Delo ELC 

50/50

Performance Plus 

HD Extended Life 

NAPS Free OAT

$10.98

Golden West 

Tech/Syn Multi-

Vehicle ATF

9.10.18

Oil & Lubricants

Multi-Purpose Automatic Tranmission Fuild in Bulk (per 

gallon)



Caldwell County

Unit Road Bid Summary

Bid Opening - 9-10-18

Texas Materials Centex Materials Duran Gravel, Inc.
Brauntex 

Materials
Martin Marietta

Colorado 

Materials

Type A Black Base (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) no bid no bid no bid $50.00 $35.50 68 (cold mix)

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX no bid no bid no bid $60.00 $63.18 75.55 (cold mix)

Type D Cold Mix (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) no bid no bid no bid $50.00 $36.50 $68.00

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX no bid no bid no bid $60.00 $64.18 $75.55

3/4" Base (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) no bid no bid no bid no bid $5.00 $4.00  (1/2")

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX no bid no bid no bid no bid $12.98 $10.89

1-1/2" Commercial Base (per ton)

At Plant (U.R.S. Pick Up) $13.00 $7.50 $5.50/yard $5.75 $4.00 $4.00

Delivered to 6655 Seawillow Rd, Lockhart, TX $22.50 no bid no bid $15.75 $11.98 $10.89

1) price is for full 

(22 tons Min) 

trailer loads. 2) 

Fluctuating Fuel 

Surcharge per 

Chart.)

9.10.18

Flexible Base



 

 

 
 

 

8. Discussion/Action  to approve a donation in the 
 amount of $900.00 to the Caldwell-Travis Soil  & Water 
 Conservation District. Cost: $900.00; Speaker:  Judge 
 Schawe; Backup: 1. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 





 

 

 
 

 

9. Discussion/Action to approve a donation to the Hays-
 Caldwell Women’s Center in the amount of  $800.00. 
 Cost: $800.00; Speaker:  Judge Schawe; Backup: 1. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 





 

 

 
 

 

10. Discussion/Action to approve a donation to the Night in 
 Old Luling Association in an amount not to exceed 
 $500.00. Cost:  $500.00; Speaker: Judge Schawe; 
 Backup: 1. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 





 

 

 
 

 

11. Discussion/Action to enter into a non-financial agreement 
 between Caldwell County and  the  Texas Department of 
 Family and Protective Services to establish and maintain a 
 Child Welfare Board pursuant to Texas Family Code 
 Section 264.005 et. seq. Cost: TBD; Speaker: 
 Commissioner Theriot; Backup: 6. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 















 

 

 
 

 

 
 

12. Discussion/Action regarding the local funding request 
 from the Caldwell County Juvenile Board for fiscal  year 
 2019. Cost: TBD; Speaker: Judge Schawe / Jay 
 Monkerud;  Backup: 2. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 







 

 

 
 

 

 
 

13. Discussion/ Action amending 6.01.1 FLSA 207(k) 
 Exemption. Cost: None; Speaker: Judge Schawe; 
 Backup: 2. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Commissioners’ Court-Monday, September 24, 2018 
County Auditor’s Office / Human Resources 

Amend FLSA 207(k) Exemption 
 

History: 
 
On July 13, 2015, Commissioners’ Court officially adopted FLSA 207(k) exemption under the 
Fair Labor Standards Act for law enforcement employees, which includes deputies and jailers. 
 
Discussion Items: 
 
Current policy is as follows:  
Caldwell County Commissioners Court has adopted 207(k) exemption under the Fair Labor 
Standards Act for law enforcement employees, which includes deputies and jailers. These 
employees have a work period of 28 days and overtime will be due after 171 hours actually 
worked. Law enforcement employees’ salary covers all hours up to 171 hours. Paid leave shall 
not be counted in determining if overtime has been worked in any workweek. Except in 
emergency situations, an employee shall be required to have authorization from their supervisor 
before working overtime. 
 
Amendment to 6.01.1 FLSA 207(k) Exemption: 
Caldwell County Commissioners Court has adopted 207(k) exemption under the Fair Labor 
Standards Act for law enforcement employees, which includes deputies and jailers. These 
employees have a work period of 14 days and overtime will be due after 85.5 hours actually 
worked. Law enforcement employees’ salary covers all hours up to 85.5 hours. Paid leave shall 
not be counted in determining if overtime has been worked in any workweek. Except in 
emergency situations, an employee shall be required to have authorization from their supervisor 
before working overtime. 
  
Notable Budget Items: 
 
Funds are available in the proposed budget in the respective law enforcement budget(s). 
 
Recommendation to Commissioner’s Court: 
 
County Auditor’s Office respectfully recommends the following: 
The Commissioners’ Court to Approve Amending 6.01.1 FLSA 207(k) Exemption. 
 
 

 





 

 

 
 

 

14. Discussion/ Action to consider executing an Interlocal 
 Agreement with Bastrop County  concerning Marshall 
 Estates subdivision located at the Bastrop / Caldwell 
 County line. Cost: None; Speaker: Commissioner 
 Moses / Kasi Miles; Backup: 5. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN BASTROP COUNTY, TEXAS AND CALDWELL 
COUNTY, TEXAS FOR THE REVIEW OF SUBDIVISION APPLICATION 

 
THIS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT (“Agreement”) is entered into and made in accordance with the 
provisions of Texas Government Code Chapter 791 known as the Interlocal Cooperation Act, by and 
between the COUNTY OF BASTROP, TEXAS, a political subdivision in the State of Texas, hereinafter 
referred to as “Bastrop County” and the COUNTY OF CALDWELL, TEXAS, a political subdivision in the 
State of Texas, hereinafter referred to as “Caldwell County”, and collectively referred to as the “Parties”. 

WHEREAS, the Interlocal Cooperation Act, Chapter 791 of the Texas Government Code authorizes units 
of local government to contract with one or more units of local government to perform governmental 
function and services; and 

WHEREAS, both Bastrop County and Caldwell County Commissioners Courts have adopted Subdivision 
Regulations pursuant to Chapter 232 of the Texas Local Government Code to promote the safe, orderly, 
and healthful development of the unincorporated areas of both Counties ; and 

WHEREAS, the 165.075 acre tract of land lying in and being situated out of the John J. Clelland Survey, 
Abstracts 397 and 75 and the I&G.N.RR.CO. Survey, Abstract 155 in Bastrop and Caldwell County, Texas,  
as described by metes and bounds in Appendix A, hereinafter referred to as the “Development Site” is a 
contiguous, unified tract of land under single ownership situated in both Bastrop County and Caldwell 
County; and  

WHEREAS, the majority of the Development Site falls within the boundaries of Bastrop County; and 

WHEREAS, the Parties recognize that the portion of the Development Site located within Caldwell 
County will be adequately protected through compliance with the Bastrop County subdivision 
regulations; and 

WHEREAS, this Agreement is entered into pursuant to the authority, under the provisions of, and in 
accordance with, chapter 791 of the Texas Local Government Code, for the performance of 
governmental functions and services; specifically, the processing and review of the proposed subdivision 
preliminary plan and final plat of the Development Site, and for such and further acts of cooperation as 
the parties may subsequently agree to by the execution of a separate and specific agreement ratified by 
the governing bodies of each contracting party, specifically by the Commissioners Court of Bastrop 
County and the Commissioners Court of Caldwell County; and  

WHEREAS, Bastrop County provides this governmental function for the citizens of Bastrop County and 
has the capacity to service the needs of Caldwell County regarding the platting of the Development Site; 
and 

WHEREAS, Bastrop County and Caldwell County have investigated and determined that it would be 
advantageous and beneficial to both Caldwell County and Bastrop County and its inhabitants for Bastrop 



County to process and review the proposed subdivision preliminary plan and final plat of the 
Development Site on behalf of Caldwell County; and 

WHEREAS, Caldwell County wishes to engage Bastrop County to process and review the proposed 
subdivision preliminary plan and final plat of the Development Site on behalf of Caldwell County to carry 
out said governmental functions; and 

WHEREAS; the governing bodies of Caldwell County and Bastrop desire to foster good-will and 
cooperation between the two entities; and 

WHEREAS, Caldwell County and Bastrop County deem it to be in the best interest of both entities to 
enter into this Agreement relative to the processing and review of the proposed subdivision preliminary 
plan and final plat of the Development Site, and for such other and additional services or governmental 
functions as the parties may subsequently agree to by the execution of separate and specific 
agreements, and in consideration of the mutual covenants contained herein, Caldwell County and 
Bastrop County agree as follows: 

1. Governmental Function to be Performed 

Caldwell County agrees to engage Bastrop County to undertake the processing and review of the 
proposed subdivision preliminary plan and final plat of the Development Site in accordance with Bastrop 
County Subdivision Regulations, together with all incidental acts, procedures, and methods necessary to 
accomplish the ends of such project. 

2. Geographic Scope 

This agreement only applies to the land located within the Development Site as described by metes and 
bounds in Appendix A.  

3.  Proceedings 

A.  The parties agree that Bastrop County shall have exclusive jurisdiction to regulate subdivision 
within the Development Site.  Bastrop County shall accept subdivision applications, and apply its 
subdivision regulations and any subsequent variations thereof to proposed plats within the 
Development Site, including that part which lies within the unincorporated area of Caldwell 
County. Bastrop County shall notify Caldwell County of any changes to the subdivision 
regulations. 

B.  Bastrop County shall be responsible for the administration of subdivision construction 
agreements, subdivision phasing agreements, and other ancillary matters.  Bastrop County shall 
be responsible for maintaining fiscal depositions and administration of fiscal security, which 
shall be collected by Bastrop County.  

C.   The Bastrop County Engineer and the Caldwell County Engineer, or their designees, shall 
perform joint construction inspections of all road and drainage improvements on behalf of 



Bastrop and Caldwell Counties, to assure construction in accordance with Bastrop County 
subdivision requirements. The parties agree that Bastrop County shall retain all proceeds from 
the fees and charges that arise from this Agreement in the provision of services described. 

D. Any roads and drainage improvements laid out in the platting process and constructed on the 
Development Site will be subject to a maintenance period per the Bastrop County Subdivision 
Regulations.  The Bastrop County Engineer and the Caldwell County Engineer, or their designees, 
will jointly inspect the road at the end of the defined maintenance period and along with the 
Bastrop County and Caldwell County Commissioners who have jurisdiction over the 
Development Site, agree upon and make a recommendation to their respective Commissioners 
Courts on whether to accept or deny the roadway section lying in their respective Counties into 
their respective County Road System for maintenance. 

4.  Duration of Agreement 

Unless mutually initiated, cancelled, or terminated earlier with thirty (30) days written notice, this 
Agreement shall commence upon execution by both Parties. This Agreement will remain in effect until 
the road and drainage improvements have successfully completed the maintenance period and the Final 
Plat has been approved by Bastrop County Commissioners Court and filed with both the County Clerk of 
Bastrop County and Caldwell County. 

5.  Compensation and Application Fees 

Bastrop County shall retain all fees received from the applicant related to the processing and approval of 
the subdivision preliminary plan and final plat.  

6. Courtesy Review 

Bastrop County will provide within ten (10) days of receipt, Caldwell County with a “courtesy copy” of 
the preliminary plan and final plats submitted to the County for the Development Site and shall notify 
Caldwell County of the final approval of the plat. 

7.  Miscellaneous Provisions 

A.    Notices:  All notices required to be given under this Agreement shall be addressed as follows 
and shall be delivered by certified mail, postage prepaid, or by hand delivery: 

      To Bastrop County:    County of Bastrop 
  Attn: County Judge 
          804 Pecan Street 
            Bastrop, TX 78602 
 
 To Caldwell County:     County of Caldwell 
  Attn: County Judge 
   110 Main St 
            Lockhart, TX 78644 



 

B. Address Change:  Either Party may change the address to which notices are to be sent by giving 
the other Party notice of the new address in the manner provided in this section.  Notices shall 
be deemed to have been received three (3) days after deposit in the mail.   

C. Parties Bound:  This Agreement shall be binding upon, and inure to the benefit of, the Parties to 
this Agreement and their respective heirs, executors, administrators, legal representatives, 
successors, and assigns. 

D. Prior Agreement Superseded:  This Agreement constitutes the sole and only agreement of the 
Parties regarding their responsibilities to each other concerning subdivision review and 
supersedes any prior understandings or written or oral agreements between the Parties 
respecting subdivision review.  This Agreement in no way modifies or supersedes any document 
executed by the Parties prior to this Agreement which does not involve subdivision review. 

E. Amendment:  No amendment, modification, or alteration of the terms of this Agreement shall 
be binding unless it is in writing, dated subsequent to the date of this Agreement, and duly 
executed by the Parties to this Agreement. 

F. General Waiver by the Parties:  The Parties hereby waive and release each other from all claims 
for loss or damage caused by any act or omission by the other, their respective employees, or 
agents, in the performance of this Agreement, except for gross negligence and/or willful 
misconduct, and except as otherwise provided by the Texas Uniform Commercial Code. 

G. Violation of Law:  The Parties shall not violate any federal, state or local laws, regulations or 
ordinances in the performance of this Agreement. 

H. Enforceability:  If any provision of this Agreement proves unlawful or unenforceable by a court 
having jurisdiction over the Parties or the subject matter, such provision shall be severable from 
the other provisions of this Agreement, and all remaining provisions shall be fully enforceable. 

I. Governing Law and Place for Performance: This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of 
Texas, which state shall also be deemed the place where this Agreement was entered into and 
the place of performance and transaction of business and Parties.  In the event of litigation 
pertaining to the Agreement, the exclusive forum, venue and place of jurisdiction shall also be 
the County of Bastrop and the State of Texas unless otherwise agreed in writing by the Parties.  
The Parties acknowledge that each has had the unfettered opportunity to review, revise and 
negotiate the terms of this Agreement, and that if in the future there is a dispute as to the 
meaning of any provision herein, then no such provision shall be construed against the drafter 
of the Agreement. 

J. Signature Warranty Clause:  The signatories to this Agreement represent that they have the 
authority to execute this agreement on behalf of Bastrop County and Caldwell County, 
respectively. 



K. No Waiver of Immunities:  Nothing in the Agreement shall be construed to waive any immunity 
from suit or liability enjoyed by the Bastrop County and Caldwell County, their past or present 
officers, employees, or agents. 

L. Approval of Governing Bodies:  This Agreement has been approved by the governing bodies of 
Bastrop County and Caldwell County. 

M. Assignment:  Neither Party may assign their interests in this Agreement except upon receiving 
the written consent of the other Party. 

 

COUNTY OF CALDWELL 

 

By: ___________________________________ 

Printed Name: Ken Schawe 
Title: County Judge 
 

ATTEST: 

 

By: ___________________________________ 

 

COUNTY OF BASTROP 

 

By: ___________________________________ 

Printed Name: Paul Pape 
Title: County Judge 
 

ATTEST: 

 

By: ___________________________________ 

 

BASTROP COUNTY DISTRICT ATTORNEY’S OFFICE 

Approved as per form:  

 

_________________________________ 

 



 

 

 
 

 

15. Discussion/Action  to execute an Interlocal 
 Cooperative  Agreement with Hays County for  County 
 Jail  Functions. Cost: None; Speaker: Judge Schawe / 
 Chief Deputy Mike Lane; Backup: 6.  
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INTERLOCAL COOPERATIVE AGREEMENT 

FOR COUNTY JAIL FUNCTIONS 

 

THIS AGREEMENT entered into this the 24th day of September, 2018 and effective the 1st of 
January, 2019, by and between Hays County, a political subdivision of the State of Texas, 
hereinafter referred  to as Hays County, and Caldwell County, also a political subdivision of the 
State of Texas, hereinafter referred to as Caldwell County. 

 
WHEREAS, Hays County is a duly organized political subdivision of the State of Texas 

engaged in the administration of county government and related services for the benefit of the 
citizens of the County; and 

 
WHEREAS, Caldwell County, is a duly organized political subdivision of the State of 

Texas engaged in the administration of county government and related services for the benefit of 
the citizens of Caldwell County; and 

 
WHEREAS, Hays County and Caldwell County desire to improve the efficiency  and 

effectiveness of local governments by authorizing the Intergovernmental contracting authority at 
the local level for all or part of the functions and services of police protection and detention 
services; and 

 
WHEREAS, Hays County and Caldwell County mutually desire to be subject to the 

provision of Chapter 791, Texas Government Code, and the Interlocal Cooperation Act. 
 

NOW, THEREFORE, Hays County and Caldwell County, for the mutual consideration 
hereinafter stated, agree and understand as follows: 

 
I. 

For the purpose and consideration herein stated and contemplated, Caldwell County shall  
provide the following necessary and appropriate services for Hays County to the maximum extent 
authorized by this agreement, without regard to disability, race, religion, color, age, sex and 
national origin; to wit: 

 
A. Accept and provide for the secure custody, care and safekeeping of inmates in 

accordance with state and local laws, standards, policies, procedures, or court orders 
applicable to the operations of the Caldwell County Jail. 

 
B. In the event that the Caldwell County Jail shall be at maximum capacity as a result of 

Caldwell County, or other, inmates, Caldwell County reserves the right to require the 
removal or transfer of Hays County's inmates within forty-eight (48) hours after notice 
to Hays County, in order to provide facilities for Caldwell County inmates, and Caldwell 
County agrees to notify Hays County as soon as possible when Hays County inmates 
must be removed from the Caldwell County Jail because of capacity limits. 
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C. Notify Hays County as soon as possible of all emergency medical cases requiring removal 

of an inmate and health care services to include transportation and guard services 
provided outside the Caldwell County Jail. All extraordinary medical care and 
prescription drugs shall be paid for by Hays County. 

 
D. In no event shall Caldwell County be required to accept Hays County inmates under the 

terms and conditions of this agreement if such transfer of inmates will cause the Caldwell 
County Jail to be in violation of the Texas Jail Standards Commission. Caldwell County, in 
its sole discretion, shall determine whether a Hays County inmate shall be accepted for 
incarceration by Caldwell County. Nothing contained herein shall be construed to compel 
Caldwell County to accept any inmate if it would place Caldwell County in violation of any 
law, regulation or court order. 

 
E. Nothing contained herein shall be construed to compel the Caldwell County Sheriff, acting 

in his capacity as keeper of the jail, to accept any inmate for any reason. 
 

II. 

 
Hays County designates Captain Julissa Villalpando as Liaison Officer for Hays County with 

and between Hays County and Caldwell County. Caldwell County designates Captain James Short as 
Liaison Officer for Caldwell County with and between Hays County and Caldwell County. The 
respective county sheriff of each county, or his/her designated substitute, shall insure the performance 
of all duties and obligations of said County herein stated; and, shall devote sufficient time and 
attention to the execution of said duties on behalf of said County in full compliance with the terms and 
conditions of this agreement; and, shall provide immediate and direct supervision of all of the 
Sheriff’s Office employees, agents, contractors, sub-contractors, and/or laborers, if any; in the 
furtherance of the proposes, terms and conditions of this Agreement of the mutual benefit of Hays 
County and Caldwell County. 

III. 

 
Hays County agrees to indemnify and hold harmless Caldwell County, its agents, and 

employees, from and against all suits, claims, damages, losses, and expenses, including reasonable  
attorney's fees, arising out of Caldwell County's performance or non-performance of the services and 
duties herein stated, but only in regard to the transfer of inmates by Hays County and duties herein 
assigned to Hays County, and specifically excluding  the  actual incarceration  of  inmates  by  
Caldwell County. Hays County retains full liability for each inmate until that  inmate has  been  
processed  and booked into Caldwell County's Jail. 
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IV. 

 
Caldwell County agrees to indemnify and hold harmless Hays County, its agents, and 

employees, from and against all suits, claims, damages, losses,  and  expenses, including  reasonable 
attorney's fee, arising out of Caldwell County's performance or non-performance of the services and 
duties herein, stated, but only in regard to the actual holding and incarceration of inmates by Caldwell 
County in Caldwell County's facilities and specifically excluding the transfer of inmates to and from 
Caldwell County. 

  
V. 

 
Caldwell County shall be solely in charge of all control, techniques, sequences, procedures, and 

means, and the coordination of all work performed under the terms  and  conditions  of  thisagreement in 
regard to the holding and incarceration of  all  properly  delivered  inmates,  shall insure, dedicate and 
devote the full time and attention of those employees necessary for the proper execution and completion of  
the  duties  and  obligations of  Caldwell County  stated  in  this  agreement, and give all attention 
necessary for such proper supervision and direction. 

 
VI. 

 

Hays County agrees to and accepts full responsibility for the acts, negligence, and/or omissions of 
all Hays County's employees, and agents, the Hays County’s sub-contractor, and/or contract laborers. 

 
VII. 

 

Contactor agrees to and accepts full responsibility for the nets of negligence and/or omissions 
of all Caldwell County's employees, and agents. 

 
VIII. 

 

Hays County agrees to and accepts the duty and responsibility for and overseeing all safety orders, 
precautions, programs, and equipment necessary to the reasonable safety of Hays County's employees, and 
agents, Hays County's sub-contractors, and/or  contract  laborers.  Hays  County further agrees to bring 
with each inmate delivered to the Caldwell County Jail all packets, jail cards, classification data and other 
information in the possession of Hays County regarding each inmate, and has the duty to advise Caldwell 
County of any known dangerous propensities of each inmate delivered to Caldwell County. 

IX. 

 

Caldwell County agrees to and accepts the duty and responsibility for and overseeing all safety 
orders, precautions, programs, and equipment necessary to the reasonable safety of Caldwell County's 
employees, and agents, Caldwell County's sub-contractors, and/or contract laborers, and all other persons 
doing work under a contract or agreement with said Caldwell County. 
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X. 

Caldwell County understands and agrees that Caldwell County, its employees, servants, agents, and 
representatives shall at no time represent themselves to be employees, servants, agents, and/or 
representative of Hays County. 

 
Caldwell County is a political subdivision of the State of Texas. The address of Caldwell 
County is: 
 
Caldwell County Judge  
201 S. Main Street 
Lockhart, Texas 78644 

 
XI. 

 

Hays County understands and agrees that Hays County, its employees, servants, agents and 
representatives shall at no time represent themselves to be employees, servants, agents and/or 
representative of Caldwell County. 

 
Hays County is a political subdivision of the State of Texas. The address of said County is: 

 
Hays County Judge 
111 E. San Antonio Street, Suite 300 
San Marcos, Texas 78666 

Hays County Jail 
1307 Uhland Road 
San Marcos, Texas 78666 

 
XII. 

 

For the services hereinabove stated, Hays County agrees to pay to Caldwell County, for the 
performance of this agreement, the sum of SIXTY-TWO AND NO/100 DOLLARS ($62.00) per day 
of each inmate confined in Caldwell County facilities. A day shall constitute any portion during a 
twenty-four (24) hour period beginning and ending at midnight. Hays County agrees to reimburse 
Caldwell County for all extraordinary medical care and prescription drugs of Hays County inmates. 
Hays County further agrees to reimburse Caldwell County for damages, which are directly caused to 
Caldwell County facilities or employees by the direct action of Hays County inmates. 

 
Caldwell County agrees to guarantee a minimum of forty (40) medium-security custody beds 

for use exclusively by Hays County inmates. In exchange for Caldwell County’s bed-availability 
guarantee, Hays County agrees to fund the forty (40) beds for inmates, regardless of whether Hays 
County has any inmates housed in the Caldwell County Jail, for the entire term specified in Section 
XIV below.  

 
At any time during the term of this agreement and in the event Caldwell County cannot 

comply with its guarantee to provide forty (40) medium-security beds, Hays County is not obligated 
to comply with its funding of said forty (40) beds. In no event shall Hays County fund said forty (40) 
beds beginning January 1, 2019 if Caldwell County does not have an employment pattern adequately 
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staffed to properly supervise Hays County’s inmates. 
 

XIII. 

 

Hays County agrees to pay to and reimburse Caldwell County, on  a monthly basis, and upon the 
submission of  documented  invoice  by  Caldwell County,  for  the  cost  of the items and expenses 
specified in and in accordance with  paragraph  XIV  of this agreement  during  the term of this agreement. 

 
XIV. 

 

This agreement shall last until October 1, 2020. This agreement may be terminated at any time, 
by either party giving thirty (30) days advance written notice to the other party. In the event of such 
termination, by either party, Caldwell County shall be compensated for all services performed to 
termination date, together with reimbursable expenses then due and as authorized by this agreement. 
In the event of such termination, should Caldwell County be overcompensated for reimbursable 
expenses as authorized by this agreement, Hays County shall be reimbursed for all such 
overcompensation. Acceptance of said reimbursement shall not constitute a waiver of any claim that 
may otherwise out of this agreement. 

 
XV. 

This agreement represents the entire and integrated agreement between Hays County and Caldwell 
County and supersedes all prior negotiations, representations and/or agreements, either written or oral. This 
agreement may be amended only by written instrument signed by both Hays County and Caldwell County. 

 
XVI. 

 
The validity of this agreement and any of its terms or provisions, as well as the rights and 

duties of the parties hereto, shall be governed by the laws of the State of Texas. Further, this agreement 
shall be performable and all compensation payable in Caldwell County, Texas. 

 
XVII. 

 

In the event that any portion of this agreement shall be found to be contrary to law, it is the 
intent of the parties hereto that the remaining portions shall remain valid and in full force and effect 
to the extent possible. 

 
XVIII. 

 

The undersigned officer and/or agents of the parties hereto  are  the  properly  authorized 
officials and have the necessary authority to execute  this  agreement  on  behalf  of  the  parties  hereto, 
and each party hereby certifies to the  other  that  any  necessary  resolutions  extending  said  authority 
have been duly passed and are now in full force and effect 

 
 

(SIGNATURES ARE ON THE FOLLOWING PAGE) 
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Executed in multiple originals on the _______ day of ____________________, 2018. 
 
 
 
__________________________________   ________________________________ 
Daniel C. Law       Gary Cutler 
Caldwell County Sheriff     Hays County Sheriff 
 
 
 
___________________________________   ________________________________ 
Ken Schawe       Bert Cobb 
Caldwell County Judge     Hays County Judge 
 
 
 
___________________________________   ________________________________ 
Terry Wright       Debbie Gonzales Ingalsbe 
Caldwell County Commissioner, Precinct 1   Hays County Commissioner, Precinct 1 
 
 
 
___________________________________   ________________________________ 
Eddie Moses       Mark Jones 
Caldwell County Commissioner, Precinct 2   Hays County Commissioner, Precinct 2 
 
 
 
 
___________________________________   ________________________________ 
Edward “Ed” Theriot      Lon A. Shell 
Caldwell County Commissioner, Precinct 3   Hays County Commissioner, Precinct 3 
 
 
 
 
___________________________________   ________________________________ 
Joe Ivan Roland      Ray Whisenant 
Caldwell County Commissioner, Precinct 4   Hays County Commissioner, Precinct 4
 



16. Discussion/Action to approve the reappointment of Judge 
Schawe and Commissioner Roland to  the Capital Area 
Council of Governments (CAPCOG) General Assembly 
and to renew annual  membership for the year 2019. 
Cost: $2038.35; Speaker: Judge Schawe; Backup: 7.

















17. Discussion/Action to approve the reappointment of Judge 
Schawe  to the Capital Area Council of Governments 
(CAPCOG) Executive Committee for the year  2019. 
Cost: None; Speaker: Judge Schawe; Backup: 7.

















18. Discussion/Action to approve Budget Amendment # 26
decreasing budget line item 001-6550- 1110 / Longevity
in the amount of $500, 001-6550-3115 / Ballot Supplies
in the amount of  $11,791, 001-6550-4510 / Repairs &
Maintenance in the amount of $7,128, and 001-6550-4610
/ Rentals in the amount of $300; and decreasing
Contingency / 001-6510-4860 in the amount of  $11,040;
and increasing budget line item 001-6550-1045  /
Temporary Election Poll Workers in  the amount of
$17,195, 001-6550-1115 / Delivery Fee in the amount of
$175, 001-6550-1150 / Temporary Election Poll  Workers
Overtime in the amount of $9,009, 001-6550-2010 /  SS
& Medicare in the amount of $1,506, 001- 6650-2030 /
Retirement in the amount of $640, 001- 6550-3010 /
Temporary Election Workers Non payroll  in the  amount
of $733, 001-6550-4310 /  Advertising and  Legal Notice
in the amount of $501, 001-6550-3110 / Office  Supplies
in the amount of $500, and 001-6550-4124 / Site support
in the amount of $500; and  netting a $0 cost to  Election.
Cost: None; Speaker: Judge Schawe; Backup: 1.



DATE: September 24, 2018

DEPARTMENT: 6550 - ELECTIONS

A B C D E

CURRENT REVISED

BUDGET REQUESTED BUDGET 

FUND/DEPARTMENT/LINE Account AMOUNT CHANGE AMOUNT

(EX.001-xxxx-xxxx) Description (Total budgeted amount) (add/subtract) (NEW budgeted amount)

001-6550-1045 Temp Election Poll Workers 7,159.00 17,195.00 24,354.00
001-6550-1115 Delivery Fee 0.00 175.00 175.00
001-6550-1150 Temp Election Poll Workers-Overtime 0.00 9,009.00 9,009.00
001-6550-2010 SS & Med 6,583.00 1,506.00 8,089.00
001-6650-2030 Retirement 3,442.28 640.00 4,082.28
001-6550-3010 Temp Election Workers Nonpayroll 12,841.00 733.00 13,574.00
001-6550-4310 Advertising and Legal Notice 2,200.00 501.00 2,701.00
001-6550-3110 Office Supplies 6,000.00 500.00 6,500.00
001-6550-4124 Site Support 4,000.00 500.00 4,500.00

001-6550-1110 Longevity 900.00 (500.00) 400.00
001-6550-3115 Ballot Supplies 30,857.00 (11,791.00) 19,066.00
001-6550-4510 Repairs & Maint 20,455.00 (7,128.00) 13,327.00
001-6550-4610 Rentals 1,000.00 (300.00) 700.00

0.00
001-6510-4860 Contingency 95,800.00 (11,040.00) 84,760.00

TOTALS 191,237.28$   -$    191,237.28$   

EXPLAIN SPECIFICALLY WHY MONIES ARE BEING TRANSFERRED INTO EACH LINE:

DUE TO SPECIAL ELECTION AND/OR OTHER UNFORSEEN ELECTIONS NEEDED.

Passed and approved in Commissioners Court by a vote of _________ aye and __________nay on this 
__________day of ______________________________, 2018.

______________________________ ______________________________
Authorized by Authorized by
County Auditor Caldwell County Judge

CALDWELL COUNTY
BUDGET AMENDMENT

FY 2017-2018



19. Discussion/Action to approve Budget Amendment # 27
decreasing budget line item 001-3253- 4260 /
Transportation in the amount of $250, 001-3253-4810 /
Training in the amount of $930, 001-3253-4820 / Juror
Expense in the amount of $193; and increasing budget
line item 001-3253-3110 / Office Supplies in the  amount
of $1,373 netting a $0 cost to Justice of the Peace
PCT 3.



DATE: September 24, 2018

DEPARTMENT: JP-PCT3

A B C D E

CURRENT REVISED
BUDGET REQUESTED BUDGET 

FUND/DEPARTMENT/LINE Account AMOUNT CHANGE AMOUNT
(EX.001-xxxx-xxxx) Description (Total budgeted amount) (add/subtract) (NEW budgeted amount)

001-3253-3110 Office Supplies 2,500.00 1,373.00$     3,873.00
001-3253-4260 Transportation 250.00 (250.00) 0.00
001-3253-4810 Training 1,250.00 (930.00) 320.00
001-3253-4820 Juror Expense 500.00 (193.00) 307.00

TOTALS 4,500.00$         -$        4,500.00$       

EXPLAIN SPECIFICALLY WHY MONIES ARE BEING TRANSFERRED INTO EACH LINE:

Justice of the Peace, PCT 3 processing outstanding obligation to dewitt poth & son.

Passed and approved in Commissioners Court by a vote of _________ aye and __________nay on this 
__________day of ______________________________, 2018.

______________________________ ______________________________
Recorded By Attested By
Caldwell County Judge Caldwell County Clerk

CALDWELL COUNTY
BUDGET AMENDMENT REQUEST

FY 2017-2018



20. Discussion/Action regarding the County's holiday
schedule for the calendar year  2019. Cost: None;
Speaker: Judge Schawe;  Backup: 1.





21. Discussion/Action to designate the day of the week on 
which Commissioners Court shall  convene for the 2019 
Calendar Year.  Cost: None;  Speaker: Judge Schawe; 
Backup: None.



22. Discussion/Action to reschedule the November 12, 2018
regularly scheduled Commissioners Court  session  and
the December 24, 2018 session due to both scheduled
on holidays. Cost: None; Speaker: Judge Schawe;
Backup: None.



23. Discussion/Action concerning approval of an Order
authorizing the filing of a Final Plat (Short  Form
Procedure) for Porter Acres Subdivision located off FM
1185 and Porter Lane. Cost: None; Speaker:
Commissioner Roland / Kasi Miles; Backup: 12.



























24. Discussion/Action regarding the renewal of the lease
of 9675 State Highway 142 in Maxwell for Precinct 3
Justice.  Cost: TBD;  Speaker: Judge Schawe;
Backup: 7.
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